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Grand Opening 

Please join us in the grand opening of Lunt 
Chiropractic on November 29, 2017! Doctor Kelsey 
Lunt and Lisa Taylor have joined forces to create a 
warm, inviting, beautiful new office within the old 
Doll Hospital on Buffalo Road in North Chili, NY. 
Dr. Kelsey has been working hard since July to 

make Lunt 
Chiropractic a 
reality and has 
made many 
changes within 
the 100 year 
old building. 
The Gates Chili 
Chamber of 

Commerce will be sponsoring a ribbon cutting 
ceremony in celebration of Lunt Chiropractic at the 
grand opening on November 29.   

What’s New 

We’ve gone electronic! In an effort to save paper 
and create efficiency, Doctor Kelsey decided to 
implement a new, top of the line software system 
for Lunt Chiropractic. This means that, when you 
enter our doors for your appointment, you will be 
able to check in automatically on an office-provided 
iPad to let the doctor know what is bothering you. 
Likewise, new patients will be able to enter all their 
information directly into the office software on the 
iPad, which ensures accuracy and HIPAA 
compliance. 

 

Lunt Chiropractic is as kid-friendly as ever! Doctor 
Kelsey has provided a friendly, inviting atmosphere 
for families to enjoy. Patients are always 
encouraged to bring their children to appointments 
if they so choose.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

Our office is also undergoing an exterior makeover 
in order to better accommodate patients and traffic! 
The back lot is to be paved within the next month, 
including widening the base of the driveway 
entrance. Eventually there will also be a separate 
entrance and egress, as the owner of the property 
has recently acquired the property next door.  

Insurance Update 

At this time, Doctor Kelsey is still waiting on 
approval from various insurance companies for 
provider enrollment. We are very aware that many 
are waiting on network approval before scheduling 
appointments, and are working hard to try to 
expedite the process in whatever way possible. 
Doctor Kelsey is currently able to accept No Fault 
insurance, Workers Compensation (new cases  

   
         

Dr. Kelsey Lunt has moved! 
 

Please join us in the celebration of Lunt Chiropractic’s 
GRAND OPENING on November 29, 2017! Ribbon 
cutting ceremony will take place at 9am at the new 
office location: 4332 Buffalo Road, North Chili NY 
14514, followed by open house and refreshments. 
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only), and any insurance policy with a deductible 
that has not been met. We encourage you to call the 
office for further clarification; Doctor Kelsey is 
working with patients in whatever way she can to 
accommodate everyone’s needs. In the meantime, 
we do not want anyone suffering if in need and 
sincerely encourage patients to contact the office 
should you need an appointment. Please refer to 
both the website and Facebook for further updates; 
we will be sure to inform everyone as soon as we 
hear more!  

 

 

What’s to Come 

In the coming weeks, you will see some changes 
and further additions at Lunt Chiropractic. Doctor 
Kelsey will be implementing Metagenics 
nutraceuticals to take care of all of your nutritional 
needs. She will be stocking supplements such as 
Magnesium, B Complex (Glycogenics), Omega 3, 
Vitamin D, and the ever popular Myocalm P.M., 
among others! Lunt Chiropractic will also be 
offering new, personalized merchandise such as t-
shirts and mugs for those who are waiting. We 
currently have stock in Sombra Gel, lumbar support 
pillows, TENs units, heating pads, ice packs and 
heel lifts to meet any other need you may have. As 
always, we appreciate your patronage and will 
continue to offer free consultations to help give 

patients a better understanding of their condition 
and what supplemental products may help. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Lunt Chiropractic also markets Young Living 
Essential Oils through Ashley Lunt, our 
independent distributor. Ashley is able to answer 
any questions you may have regarding this quickly-
expanding industry and help select specific oils to 
aid in problems for which you are looking to utilize 
oils. Ashley can also formulate custom body 
butters, chapstick, roller blends, bath bombs and 
more for a host of different issues, which also 
makes for great gifts for the holidays!  

Doctor Kelsey is excited to announce the 
verification of her business by Google, and wants to 
thank each and every patient who has contributed 
or left positive feedback. She is overwhelmed by the 
support from all of you who have helped take Lunt 
Chiropractic from a dream to a reality. Please 
continue to leave reviews on Google, Healthgrades, 
and Facebook to further aid in our exposure to the 
community as a new office!  

 

            


